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The HIGH END SOCIETY website 
is now also accessible by mobile 
and smart phones.  
 
“Standing still is a step backwards” 
That is a well-known proverb. No-
wadays, it is more important than 
ever to be familiar with modern 
communication devices. The web 
2.0 was only just gaining ground, 
while there’s already another new 
mega-trend being observed in 
Europe: It’s the mobile internet!  
 
The mobile internet is booming in 
Germany. Internet anywhere and 
anytime: mobile internet use is cur-
rently one of the Germans’ favour-
ite pastimes. It works best with a 

Smartphone, which is a mobile tele-
phone with a particularly large, and 
mostly touch-sensitive, display. In 
2010, every third device sold will 
be a smartphone. According to the 
results of the “Mediascope Europe 
2009” study, issued by the EIAA 
(European Interactive Advertising 
Association), 16 million people in 
Germany access the internet using 
mobile broadband connections. 
More than 5 million people use the 
mobile internet for an average of an 
hour a day. This means that German 
users spend virtually double the 
time surfing the mobile internet as 
they do reading magazine or news-
papers. This new, unrestricted free-
dom is fun and opens up a whole 
new range of opportunities. Restau-
rants in the immediate vicinity, cur-
rent timetables or even just the local 
weather forecast can be downloaded 
onto the device in real time. 
 
With the HIGH END 2010, the 
High End Society is launching mo-
bile websites for all standard, inter-
net-capable mobile phones. From 
now on both visitors and anyone in-
terested in taking a look can access 
the new mobile internet presence at 
http://m.highendsociety.de.  
 
This is your opportunity to take a 
virtual tour through the halls, plan 
your journey or pre-plan your route 
through the exhibition. Mobile users 
can find their orientation during the 
exhibition as well with the help of 
the mobile hall map, or get informa-
tion on events currently taking 
place. Search for brands and exhibi-
tors is easily done in a matter of 
seconds. 
  

During development, we made a 
conscious decision not to do the 
programming using platform-based 
software (so-called “Apps”), as we 
wanted to reach as broad a public as 
possible with a non-brand depend-
ent website, and be able to reach all 
users of smartphones. 
 

  
We will therefore be successively 
extending the mobile website to 
other events organised by the HIGH 
END SOCIETY, so that you are al-
ways up-to-date when out and 
about. 
 

 
 
(Alle Information, Angaben und Erläuterungen ohne 
jegliche Gewähr). 
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